
CRHS SCHOLARSHIP FUND MASTER LIST 
 

 
  Award Name Award Criteria 
 Philip A. Arcand Memorial Awarded to a graduating boy ranked in middle 3rd of the class who participated 

in sports and school activities. 
 

 The Atwell Memorial Scholarship Fund (in memory of 
Bishop R. & Mabel Trischman Atwell) 

Awarded to a student with at least a B- average in grades 11 & 12 who has 
been accepted at an accredited 4-year college.  Requires evidence of varied 
community service and some basis for need of financial assistance (preferential 
consideration​ to a direct descendent of the family) 
 

 Baruschke Memorial Scholarship Awarded to a student who is a "B" student and preferably intends to major in a 
language. 
 

 Patricia W. Breese Memorial 
 
 
Brewster PTO 
 
 
Julia C. Bryant 
 
 
 
 
Esther G. Burnham Memorial 
 
Wilda Castro Memorial Award 
 
 
 
 
Class of 2011 
 
Sydney A. Coe Memorial 
 
 

Awarded to a graduating senior who plans to become a special education 
teacher 
 
Awarded to a graduating senior who attended Brewster/Korn schools and has 
been involved in school/community service.  Preferably interested in teaching 
and education and shows some financial need. 
 
Awarded to a student with an interest in music or elementary education. 
Financial need is important. 
 
 
No special restrictions. Possible interest in education is a plus 
 
Awarded to a senior with identified challenges who has shown the 
determination, motivation and inner fortitude to achieve their personal best 
while showing kindness, compassion and respect to others. 
 
 
Student active in student council for all 4 years and demonstrates leadership 
 
Awarded to a student with interests in the medical field (primarily pediatrics), 
nursing/pediatric, and/or early childhood special education. 
 



Coginchaug Basketball Club 
 
 
Gregory Curtis Memorial 
 
 
Janet Donovan Memorial 
 
 
 
 
Durham Volunteer Ambulance Corps  
 
 
 

Awarded to a boy and girl that played for CBC for at least (1) season from 
grades 5-8. 
 
Awarded to a student with interests in public service, government and/or 
environment 
 
Awarded to a student who has an interest in teaching; shows a demonstrated             
love for reading and writing. Looking for a student also involved in the             
community 
 
 
Awarded to a student with confirmed interest in becoming an EMT or            
Firefighter. Student who will pursue a course of study in the healthcare field.             
Student who will pursue a course of study in, or will be working in the field of                 
public health or public safety. 
 
 
 

 J. Bruce Eagleson Memorial 
 
 
 
Dr. Kevin S. Frank Memorial Tennis Scholarship 
 
 
 
Gary & Ophelia Frazier Award 
 
 
 
Deborah Haggerty Memorial Scholarship 
 
 
Carie Hammond Memorial 
 
 
 
 

Awarded to 1 boy and 1 girl who played at least one varsity sport and 
maintained an overall B average. 
 
 
Dr. Frank was the best kind of Tennis Dad.  He wished a scholarship be 
awarded to a deserving player(s) who display good sportsmanship and a deep 
love of the game. 
 
Awarded to a student interested in majoring in healthcare/medical studies. 
Financial need is a consideration. 
 
 
Awarded to a student interested in athletics with a good sense of humor and a 
positive attitude, who is a good citizen and reflects good sportsmanship. 
 
Awarded to a senior with a definite commitment to further his or her education. 
 
 
 



Etzie Heyl Appreciation Award 
 
 

Awarded to a student in the top 25% of class who is pursuing 4-year college 
and has a strong athletic participation and/or extra-curricular participation. 
Preferably a student who exemplifies leadership and participates in community 
service. 

.  
John Lyman Parent Association 
 
 
 
Howard Francis Kelley Memorial 
 
 
 
Kathlene Koritko Scholarship Award 
 
 
 
 
Lino's Market Scholarship Award 
 
 
Charles Mauro Memorial 
 
Heather MacDonald Memorial Scholarship Fund 
 
 
 
 
Mid Lea Garden Club 
 
 
Lewis Steven Moss Memorial 
 
 
John Murphy Jr. Memorial 
 
New Haven Raccoon Club Scholarship 
 

 
Awarded to a student who attended John Lyman, is pursuing a career in 
elementary education and has exhibited leadership qualities and participation in 
volunteer community services. 
 
Awarded to a student entering a four year college preferably with an interest in 
studying science or math emphasizing the student’s leadership qualities and 
commitment to community service. 
 
Awarded to a student who is an academic achiever, volunteers in the 
community and actively participates in school & community functions 
 
 
 
Awarded to a student interested in culinary studies or business or 
entrepreneurship. 
 
Awarded to a student Interested in history 
 
Awarded to a student who volunteers in his/her community (not just when 
required for a class) and wants to pursue a degree in higher education, social 
work, art therapy or a related field (psychology, sociology). 
 
 
Middlefield boy or girl pursuing an education in landscaping, horticulture, 
forestry, environmental studies 
 
Awarded to a student with an interest in teaching or an education related field 
with an emphasis on good citizenship 
 
Awarded to a student who “hustles” whether it is on the field, the court or in life 
 
Awarded to a student with an interest in forestry, environmental science or 
conservation 



Alice P. Newton 
 
Ellen M Patterson 
 
 
 
Kathleen Paulson Scholarship Fund 
 
Craig M Pearson Memorial and Deirdre Pearson  
Johnson Memorial 
 

Awarded to the #1 ranked student in the class 
 
Awarded to a girl student who is most well rounded with an emphasis on 
leadership, compassion and commitment to fellow students. Financial need or 
superior scholarship are not factors. 
 
Awarded to a student with an interest in hotel/restaurant management 
 
Awarded to a student with an interest in nursing who has participated in             
community service. 
 

 Teddy Pecor Memorial 
 
 
Elizabeth Mary Pernel Memorial 
 
 
Powerhold Scholarship Fund 
 
 
Nancy L. Planeta Special Education Scholarship 
 
 
Frank Preisner Memorial Scholarship 
 
 
Regional School District #13 Education Association (REA) 

Awarded to a hard working student with definite college goals. A good sense of              
humor is a consideration and trade/tech school is preferred. 
 
Awarded to a student who best exemplifies determination, dedication, integrity, 
courtesy and sensitivity 
 
Awarded to a student with an interest in mechanical engineering, manufacturing           
engineering, business administration, or any other type of engineering. 
 
Awarded to a student looking to pursue special education or a special 
education student continuing their education. 
 
Awarded to a student pursuing studies in the building trades (engineering,           
architecture, etc.). 
 
Awarded to a student with an interest in teaching or a related educational field,              
preferably a student who has been in the district all 12 yrs or most thereof 
 

 Bruce E. Schmottlach Music Award 
 
 
 
Mark Spatuzzi Appreciation Award 
 
 
 
 

Awarded to a student who intends to major in music. First preference given to              
member of the CRHS band with more potential then any other music student.             
Final choice should have approval of CRHS music department 
 
Awarded to a student with financial need. 
 
 
 



Elwin L Stannard American Legion Post 184 Durham 
 
 
 
Strong School Parent Organization 
 
 
Mary and J. Richard Taylor Award 
 
 
 
Torrison Stone and Garden Triple Threat Sports Award 
 
 
Andrea Bradley Tucker Memorial 
 
 
Barbara West Nursing Scholarship 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Edith White Memorial - Durham Volunteer Fire  
Company Ladies Auxiliary 
 
Leo and Dorothy Willett Award 
 
 
 
Brenna Zettergren Memorial 
 
 
 

Awarded to a student who has financial need and an interest in government or              
political science. Special consideration for family background in military service. 
 
 
Awarded to a student that attended Strong School for both 7​th & 8​th grades.              
Financial need is considered. 
 
Awarded to a student who may have struggled at some point academically but             
will benefit from continuing his/her education. Strong guidance        
recommendation. 
 
Awarded to a student who participates in 3 sports and excels in the classroom              
as well. 
 
Awarded to a student who has an interest in working with/helping special needs             
children 
 
Mrs. West, longtime resident of Durham, spent much of her life working as an 
RN on the Orthopedics Floor of Middlesex Memorial Hospital and in local 
Nursing Homes.  Gifted with the warmest and most gentle of dispositions, she 
dedicated her entire life to caring for, nurturing and celebrating everyone she 
came in contact with.  Her family and friends have chosen to honor her memory 
with a Nursing Scholarship to a student who best reflects her sunny disposition 
and deep concern for others. 
 
 
 
Awarded to a student with an interest in medicine, health, agriculture, or            
communications. Financial needs are important. 
 
Awarded to a Durham resident (boy or girl) with real financial need who exhibits              
a firm commitment to a 4 year program and who has demonstrated great             
potential in any field. 
 
Awarded to a senior who has shown strength in character of provided friendship             
to someone in need 
 
 



Ty Zemelsky Rising Artist Scholarship 
 

Awarded to a senior who loves the arts, visual or otherwise and hopes/plans to              
continue to involve the arts in their life, whether furthering their education or life              
in general. 
 

 Tyler and Nathan McDonald Achievement Award Awarded to a student involved in both music and athletics while maintaining at 
least a 3.0 average.  This award is to recognize a student’s varied interests and 
effort it requires to be successful while juggling so much. 
 

  
Karen J. Ostby Memorial Scholarship 

 
Awarded to a student who has overcome adversity and has shown respect for 
others. 

  
Coginchaug Valley Education Foundation Scholarship 
 
 
 

 
Awarded to a student planning to continue at either a 2 or 4 year institution. 
The senior should demonstrate a love of learning through programs or activities 
such as CUSP, Scouts or a significant commitment to a project. 
 

 Lorraine A. Coe Memorial Scholarship 
 

Awarded to a student seeking a career in either manufacturing, medical billing 
or cosmetology.  The student should demonstrate a genuine appreciation of 
others, strong work ethic, and strong desire to be of service to others. 
 

 John H. and Margery S. Stahl Memorial Scholarship Awarded to assist a deserving student achieve their dreams of success through 
higher education. 
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